Clayton County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation Form
IFB No. 024-13
Occupational Therapists, Physical Therapists
Speech Language Pathologist - Part Il

O pationa P % pee

61.00

360 Degree Customer, Inc. $ 61.00] $ 61.00 | $

Comprehensive Therapy Consultants 3 5390 | $ 57.00 | $ 53.90
Advanced Medical Personnel Services, Inc. $ 5300 % 5400 | $ 55.00
Alvarez Advancement Services, Inc. $ 5400 | $ 54.00 No Bid
All Source Recruiting Group d/b/a Ardor Health Solutions | $ 57.00| $ 57.00| $ 57.00
Community Rehab Associates, Inc. $ 5985 | % 6245 | $ 53.00
Darden Speech Therapy No Bid No Bid | $ 56.00
Delta-T Group $ 7000 | $ 7000 | $ 70.00
Educational Based Services $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
Every Voice Counts, Inc. $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 57.50
Inspire Path Systems Corporation $ 56.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 56.00
Jackson Therapy Partners, LLC $ 5250 | $ 5250 | $ 52.50
Jennifer Pollock Shankle NoBid | $ 54.00 No Bid
New Direction Solutions, LLC d/b/a Bilingual Therapies | $ 57.00 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 57.00
ProCare Therapy $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
Signature Learning Resources, Inc. $ 5200 1| $ 5200 | $ 50.00
SHC Services, Inc. d/b/a Supplemental Health Care $ 53.00 | $ 53.00 | $ 53.00
Soliant Health $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
Staffing Options and Solutions, Inc. $ 55.50 No Bid | $ 54.00
Therapists Unlimited (A Division of Careerstaff Unlimited)| $ 5390 % 58.00 | $ 53.90
Therapy Source, Inc. $ 57.78 | $ 57.78 | $ 55.78
Top Echelon Contracting, Inc. $ 61.00 | $ 61.00| $ 61.00

BID OPENED
Date: Monday, April 22, 2013
Time: 2:00 p.m.

This is to certify that this a true and correct copy
correct copy of the tabulation of bids opened.

ty Pub%chom

LONitB. Collier, CPPO, CPM
Director of Business Services







